TG 5T (& @ I e <
FROGIEIET  (JURVM) ALATQIT, 0%
(AT 0% T AERTSS 3MEATR3T 3. ¢) -
BSI91G 39M FR{GT 9 Y9 Q™ <€
PROGEE ARTIH RY8 T HAH
AY T FHH § Tl BRI S

TSRO

HERTSE IMHA
Hege) T I fqHmT

I IRYFAH HHID - S8H-038/U.5h. Y/TA-1
HIGTH BT A, FATH] ST AT,
HATH, {dg -g00 033.

e o¢ 3MMFCIER, 038

gET- 9. BEEIE $9M FHeT 9 AW AGEr E HRUAEEA
(RETRM) STRAFTH 2094 ([ 09y =1 HERTS: AT

$.Y)
2. T&HAM 93.0¢.203% Sl ST ARHSD TBHIIH

fyofar
3. BEEIE W fRGE 9 W SMEM T HRUIEEd
(GETRUT) 37EITG3T, 208 ( AT 038 IT HERTSS AT

%. ¢)

UKATdT =-

HRIGATS] [IHNTe AGTHRT 9 ST gade 39/ Fieq g g
3TgaT € BRUITETEd AfAFTIH, 994y Al RG] S BIAId. ARIGATSIIS 3MS
RTeR9e TTa1E S g G 3G Y€ BRUATIE AT, 9%Ys < B §(9) =T
AR AR 3R URUAD, HEGes [GHHT I HIA 904R VI-L, &.08.09.9%¢0 3=
GFId HIJIR TS IRFRRIGHR 4.09.00.9%¢0 ISl SAHGR AT SIS
STHIMT WTHAT (Abolition) o IMTAATHRS Hfgd HRUATd T, aud, A1 Srferf=raHran
HH € (3) AT eI ATHRY Iz YIRANRERT BTl g 9T FHRoard
gy S T ATTHISY WFSTER R =T IR SAMGR, BIGIS-U-ha |, HIIH
$B 9 WY @ Arddbgd ST deblos ™ IR TSR/ AREe] Jod U
JTHET (Regrant) HRUATT 3MTe3 3ATe. ARIGATS] [AURIIIIS AETHIRT S SIR=aT
BRITRUTEGR 25EIG 391 e 9 I AT € HRUIEEd AIH, R4y o
FAT & (3) 3 Y B, IRISaATST fAYTITT ATST YHTOMAR TdB=AT+T §1T ST
gRUT HAeTT IMd. IT S THRICEIRRAT SWIaR0l M3l 3Med. I
SR e BHT BRuarISt BaTdre 3™ Mo g /19 Jgar Y& HRUGTEEd
AR, aQyy =T B ¢ ALY | 209y ALY FURVIT HRUATT TS AR, TATY,
ARG AT S FHodh T SXdiaRumigYTd MU BTa! fHde BH! BRoT a3 d




3T URUZ hATD: §6PH-303%8/T.5h. RY4/SI-19

BId. g =T aH R (Q) (3) WD TG 99Ul Broadl Wueday
JNUATETH® THRONT ST Hobd (9) T YOI MSAT YHRUT] HIRISINR deraT,
frafiadr TurTaITSt Ue auten wraradi 7ater arefio srazad B,

Hex ST SUAIRET arefavardre! a8 3= Sl Brared iR
HRUI AFT BT ATATS! BRUATA] B BT GHRO BRUATE] IR AT ST
Bl ATHRAT YR dRuIE fcsed] Aicred] BIerRaig  sgasd I
AMe®reT 13.93.¢.20%% IS STosed] dodkiles MURITHR Saa At
FSH 2 (V) T HAH & I 13.28.%.202% ol URIeg HRUATT NS AT BSdIE 34
PRI @ G 3G Y€ HRUATEIE (GHRM) ALATG3T, 2038 (T 038 AT AERTS
TGl . ¢) AT YR HRUI TS M2, ITIHIH Fd G g
forifag exvar 919 foemRTed= 8.

AT IRIAD -

SSTETE M MR I I QT & HRUIEE (JETRUM) LTS3, 2039 (T
038 I HERTSE TR . ¢) Il Ud Siiea] 3 2amEe $9M e 9 19
3TIQT JE HRUIEIEA STUFIH, R4y T HHH R (V) T HSH & A IT FITQRTER
HRUATT AT IRV SHSFISUT Fa Aeferd [TegiedRT JieT BRrdl. Arge
2SI 3 ST g G G IE HRUJEE AR, 994y 3fcid Jor=ar
HETHRT ST YNECIER di-9 AR BRI HRUIMASY/ YUY JATSTATATS!
IO MBS BIaRY FAHT BRI Yo% Vashl 4% FAD! ToIRIO IFHH
THRUATT ITel. S AT TR SSIT IhH BHIUITE! I3 DRUYNT Il
SN

2. TSMEIE 3™ SHIM g G ST V& HRUATEIE STRIH, Q48 T H&H 2 ()
TAR e Tesared] Foade Bl SHEEadl ae aiie A-Taard
TR AITSATAT MURITER GRiarg] HRuArE §g9= A§eld Io0eR 81,
foRIya: sam S AeddrT e fhar RagadamT e IEEadr ag J1. S

TATA T AT HI. Q‘Iq\(l'c'd YTITAITI 1T d HI. 3= HTATA AT AT HI. Hd[<d
YSAH EEd o fegm @1 Fogar dedia Riesrert g

3. BSEIE 3 S g IRG ST & BRUIEEd JAfRTIH, 948 I H3H §(9)
TAR TG SIISARI -31, BoR ABSC TAR AGTHRE] FUH SBR BRUATT AT
STHIF SR G drsi< gath I, 948 TT HoH Y()3TaY aath HTHHRIT B[
SR ol 3G TR, 9 die SUdd SR bosed] Sl G e
HRUYT AT T IT STHI AT AU aiTebd ATe! AIqd Hege ATHSHETTAR &1 SHI
ASTHTRT U Al ST BIRIATs] BRUATT IS T, ATH O R Y TS HodrIdR

73 3 et R



3T URUZ hATD: §6PH-303%8/T.5h. RY4/SI-19

IR RIS Mo 3T eard AvE0 q8ge AWeE e Huar
HTRIATE! HRAT IS 3.
g, 3 ARG, H8Y 9 I fAUNT hHib-SHIM-09¢/9.5. Ro/S-9 fa=Tih
¢.3.209R I faIeh 21.3.2033 ANy ARYITAR AT HSTHRT S HIESTER ai-9
ALY BUIARY] HRAT/HYAR TAISTARITS] HRUATT s oh] BRI AT BT
BYICRYT AT Yekhd < q PICT Uall 3ffereh T8, T2 YR BRI HRUITYE]
STIRATET & AT HUATe I,

|eX AN URUF® HERIS,  /MAITRT - www.maharashtra.gov.in Il
HhRYBIIR TRTES HRUYTT ATeh 3G T Hehelich shHld 038900 IEZELYRAR
37T 3Te.

HSNIBQIC\I NTSgUTS ] 31IC\{QII:J,HI‘< ENICIGA

Digitally signed by SANJAY AUDUMBAR DHARURKAR

DN: c=IN, 0o=GOVERNMENT OF MAHARASHTRA, ou=RELIEF AND
REHABILITATION DEPARTMENT,

2.5.4.20=637145fd393d6d5c713e94e6da7bc6bee23011448b7fc64d13863
0b9c76ae7a2, postalCode=400032, st=Maharashtra,

D H A R U R KA R serialNumber=FCF7172A73579B34F A622983D8FB647780FBEF1D35A1CA
975955EB9193F3F800, cn=SANJAY AUDUMBAR DHARURKAR

Date: 2024.10.08 16:32:51 +05'30'

(ST YT DY)
U Afya, AERTE 3N

By

AL A 3R & F4d, 939169, 4ds,

AL ITRGHAT (7]8) T A, H31e5 9, a5

AL ITRGHAT (e g (roT) A< Afa, 931aa,4ds

A1, faR1ET gersan, famaRye/ fgrrar, FeRTe fagmva,gas

A1 H3] (HEge) ATd WIeTil i, H316d, 498,

faETH SO qd T HEH Faw,

U SmgeT, B FHS TR

. Ricg1ferer, saud |9l TR, wRyoh, M, SeH, diks, drs,
YRR, SIR.

Q. d YR 9T, H3Te3 Y, Has.

0. g (ERINTT T-U9)

N G oo & X ww N o

7S 3 U 3


http://www.maharashtra.gov.in/

RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/35530

g 20, 3F ¢ TR, TR ¥, R0RY/AMYaT 3, Th R¥E [0 3, fwa :®sw@ R3.00

AATARUT HHF ¥3

TTTErhel HhTIT

R furresm afufam @ e wEfua Fae SRy F wed faftam,

SHATUTERT
T R0R% AT HERTE ALATAH FHHIE ¢.— CEEE 3T o I FEH E HOgEmEa e, 24y A g
STMURET RO FUAIIS! STEATII. 2-3
wEger o g ferumr

HATCTT, WIRTH SHTHT HI, AT ISH[E =ik, GaIg Yoo o3, faHih 3y LR 0¥,
MAHARASHTRA ORDINANCE No. VIII OF 2024.
AN ORDINANCE

FURTHER TO AMEND THE HYDERABAD ABOLITION OF INAMS AND
CASH GRANTS ACT, 1954.

| 0% AT HERTE FARH FHHIE ¢.

TWERE W T TG AR T IWAEET AAa, 2’9y I
VTG IRV FIVATHIST HEATII.

Sararelt, T fqumreasre St TR sfuEee el TR ;
)

HIT IR-¥3—R



R TERTE IMHA TS FAEARUT WA IR, WRa¥ ¥, 0%/ R, Tk R¥E

Sfor sarerefl, o1 AT fciear FESHIHHA, TR T F I ST T HOAGT o o s
i, L]0y AT STURET GEROT FIUITAIR T HERTSTAT ISAUTCAT ATcehle ShTaTe! 0l Sies  sifufras whuis <.

TTH T 379N TR 2Aeeand TR el EEl T2 3%;

AT, ATAT, TRATAT WAGHTAT T[T 23 =M TS (2) §N UGH shoted ATahRIan

AR FHE-, TERT ISFUTA, ATFR, Tl ST AT FId 3T :—
e A 7 2. (R) IT STARTNY, TS T T G SRH F I (GEROM) STEARI, 0%,
T T,
(R) T, ATChIes SHCATT .

T 2]uy, = . TSETE W F I IFRIM TE UM i, ]uy (I ATqe s s, “qer
EE ST b sr e 3R) ATAT HoH 3T THIA, Te-Fom (3) 7R, TEIeT TWsh T I

A ¢ I
ol 33 W HLOATT TgeT i —

e “miq, ST IR UHROTHE, Ui-shetd (R) Wietlel tfushr=arear fHorare
3iifterea fohar Fafaauon qurgor eTavas 37%, 379l TT WHRE WEl U2l 3he @
3T ATIPRIET SR HL Fget.”.

T RjuL T 3. A SMUEETT Feld § Hed, Uie-dor (3) Wil —
EgTaTs arfufam .
e & <f (37) ufgea Washmer, “ o <ah 7 A1 geTeRastt, ¢ ura <ok 8T AT
FYRT.
T AT g ;

() gE=a WhmHict, “ 37em SEreAT =] SR oA T <Fh  E
TSI, ST & foahTut STTetr 21 @ Siet fashmott camarstt, « arem Stferea =] aTeiR

eATeAT UTe 2ok . &1 AT SRt ShivaTd aget;

(R) Te () 7, WIHTTEe, “ T 2ok A1 ATpuastt, < urer 2 &1 IeTehe
TR HI0ITT I

SOU

It
A C.



TERTE IEA TS FHIERUT 9T 91, GLa ¥, 0R¥/3AMET R, Th R¥% 3
=

2IEE T o G IR g HOAEE I, 2’y (]uy 1 ERETE tufEn
ST ¢) AT hotd 3T T T GauTdier [dafetd TeaiaR (o Suaren Io GIhrR=AT fohall
3Mehd hotodn ifeRr=area SATyRRTE enfoT =TT Seledr SFaii-T Meetasry & faumi
3G FTeATRS Ut IRIA FHIUATHT TG hell 3718, 3T FHotd 3T =T We-Fod (3) 7ed el
3o Toha Fafaaquon Fifawd Tt Qe FE AT YESHEET g st
SHTHEHTSTE HITETS AT Fifet.

R, Toatera sam Sfeiean STl aie-shem 3T 3Fad 3T shotedl SR feeiean
STITITEAT ISR, foafeta qehRie Sehsll hodTeaR, ST TSI YARIET0T HIvare
TYHRAT Fehall TR ShotedT faviiia ST ek 619 AT G, 39T hotH 37 AT Tie-shotd
(3) T AT GEROM HI0ITS TEATT hed 378

3. AW ST 916] SR JedTeA] TR 29h Saen! T0ehH Ao WU 7 faatd 38
TEUH IR YT HoaTaR TR S SEicioT SHivareaT, STrdehd seiaeul Hamd sHioare
T AT FUAOT FHUATAT TR, TR MM, T 024 o1 TERTE 3ifafa i 4
ABR, I SMEFIHTAT FHe & A1 Ue-FHord (3) Ted FoROT FHell 3. 39 qe-Ferd (3) =
T 3k aNTHES 379N AT STSTREEATT a1 Selel! 3Tea, o) [HiSe helean GERuaR
3TN SATHAT BT, TR0 fehal SHIaRUT SFRUITAET SR SREheT 3o HfawTs Hesd
Fretett fafay Faga onfor 3o Qfbdrt FIeRy foamTd 5ar, 39 Ferd & T gang guron
FHEA, TAM SIS FXATRoT, Fatdieor 9 Yraeard SuiaroT FHIUAMETE! Hetd & =1 Yie-herd
(3) 33, TRT TSI TSRIUATH THRH HH F0T TEYTH TR, 3 .

¥, oY foUMHEST 3Rt TUTeie StEH =] AR ST WIS FSHR ! S5
T F MG 3FRH T FOAETET S, 20y AT STV RO HIUATRNAT, HeRTT=AT
ST AT FIFETE! 0T SIS 3TEvgeh @Ta 3T IR TR STeaege i
T Yol 3T, WU, &1 TRyl WAy hoard ad 31,

oIE, W, o, g,
foh 30 e J0R¥. TERTS oI,

HERTSZTE AT It SRER o A/aH,

T FAR,
AT 3R =T .

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004
EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



RNI No. MAHENG /2009/35528

ag R0, 3F 9| H@AR, HEaX ¥, R0R¥/AMET R, TF WR¥E [7 3, fFmar @ B9 Q.00

STUTAUT HHTH §¢

PUBE TR Gt E
eRTg  fAuHesr W 9 IsauTeiFt TREfia delal TEUTeY 9 doel fafras enfor
faftr @ =ma faurmega srael fagas (Susht rgae).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants (Amendment) Ordinance, 2024

(Mah. Ord. VIII of 2024), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH WAGHOLE,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

[ Translation in English of the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2024 (Mah. Ord. VIII of 2024), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.]

REVENUE AND FORESTS DEPARTMENT

Mantralaya, Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk,
Mumbai 400 032, dated the 24th September 2024.

MAHARASHTRA ORDINANCE No. VIII OF 2024.
AN ORDINANCE

further to amend the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and
Cash Grants Act, 1954.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature are not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra is satisfied that
circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate
Hyd. Act action further to amend the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants

Ngl ;7;? Act, 1954 for the purposes hereinafter appearing ;
(0) .
(?)

HOT AB-&¢—2%



R AERTZ A TSI AAERIT WET A6, LR R¥, 0% /AT R, T R¥E

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1)
of article 213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of Maharashtra is
hereby pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance, namely :—

Short title and 1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams
commencement. and Cash Grants (Amendment) Ordinance, 2024.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

Amendment 2. In section 2A of the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants

ofsection 2A Aot 1955 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), to
of Hyd. Act . . .
No. VIII of Sub-section (3), the following proviso shall be added, namely :—
1955. “ Provided that, where in exceptional cases, upon complaints
regarding legality of decision of officer under sub-section (1), the State
Government is satisfied that it is necessary to examine the legality,
propriety or regularity of such orders even after expiry of the period of
one year, the State Government or the Divisional Commissioner
authorised by it, may exercise such powers after expiry of the said
period.”.
Amendment 3. In section 6 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),—
of section 6 of
Hyd. Act No. (1) in clause (a),—

VIII of 1955.
(a) in the first proviso, for the words “fifty per cent.”, the words
“five per cent.” shall be substituted ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “fifty per cent. of the
current market value of such land”, at both the places where they
occur, the words “five per cent. of the current market value of such
land” shall be substituted ;

(2) in clause (b), in the proviso, for the words “fifty per cent.”, the
words “five per cent.” shall be substituted.

Hyd. Act
No. VIII
of 1955.



HERTE ITEA TS0 FHEARUT AT 316, AW ¥, R0 /AMVaT R, Tk R¥E 3

STATEMENT

Section 2A of the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants Act,
1954 (Hyd. Act No. VIII of 1955) provides for the powers of the State
Government or authorised officer to decide certain questions relating to
Inams and filing of appeals by aggrieved persons before the Collector and
the Divisional Commissioner. Sub-section (3) of said section 2A provides
that, the Government may, where no appeal is filed, call for the record of the
proceedings of the authorised officer for the purpose of satisfying itself as to
the legality, propriety or regularity of proceedings or decisions after the
expiry of the period for appeal but not later than one year from such decision.

2. The Government upon inquiry into certain complaints about the
legality of the orders passed by the authorised officers under sub-section 2A
in respect of certain Inam lands is satisfied that such orders needs to be
revised. Therefore, in order to enable the Government or the Divisional
Commissioner authorised to undertake revision of such orders in exceptional
cases, sub-section (3) of the said section 2A is proposed to be amended,
suitably.

3. The Government has by the Maharashtra Act No. XXV of 2015
amended sub-section (3) of section 6 of the said Act with a view to provide
for transfer, regularisation of unauthorized transfer and conversion of the
occupancy of Inam lands on payment of fifty per cent., of current market
value of such land as a Nazarana and certain penalty to the State Government.
The Government has formed a committee of revenue officers to study the
provisions of said sub-section (3), need to amend the same and their possible
consequences. The said Committee in its report has stated that in past
several years there has been increase in market value of such lands, due to
which response from the grant holders is less for transfer, regularization or
conversion of such lands as per the above referred amendment. Therefore,
the said Committee recommended to reduce the amount of Nazarana. In
view of various representations received from representatives of people and
the recommendation of the said Committee, it is considered necessary to
reduce the amount of Nazarana for transfer, regularisation and conversion
of the occupancy of Inam lands payable under sub-section (3) of the said
section 6 by suitably amending the said section.

4. As both Houses of the State Legislature are not in session and the
Governor of Maharashtra is satisfied that circumstances exist which render
it necessary for him to take immediate action further to amend the Hyderabad
Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants Act, 1954, for the purposes aforesaid,
this Ordinance is promulgated.

Mumbai, C. P. RADHAKRISHNAN,
Dated the 20th September 2024. Governor of Maharashtra.

By order and in the name of the
Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJESH KUMAR,
Additional Chief Secretary to Government.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH
MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT
DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004
EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



		2024-10-08T16:32:51+0530
	SANJAY AUDUMBAR DHARURKAR




